



# Site Preparation for A New Herbert High School (2017-013sp)

Time Completed 2:11

Owner: Kanawha County Board of Education Phone: (304) 348-6120 Fax: (304) 348-6112 Email: [acummings@mail.kana.k12.wv.us](mailto:acummings@mail.kana.k12.wv.us)  
 Architect: Williamson Shriver Architects, Inc. Phone: (304) 345-1060 Fax: (304) 345-3693 Email: [postbids@wsgarch.com](mailto:postbids@wsgarch.com)

Due Date / Time: December 4, 2019 at 2:00 p.m.

## Site Preparation

ENVELOPE 1

Bidder	Acknowledgement of Addenda	Valid Bid Bond	Contractors License	Purchasing Affidavit	Drug Free Affidavit	BASE PROPOSAL	UNIT PRICE (ADD OR DEDUCT)					
							Earthwork	Side Core	Over	Exc. of Slips	Portland Cement or Lime	
							Toe Key Per CY	Drains Per LF	Excavation Per CY	& Sloughs Per CY	Per Ton	
A.L.L. CONSTRUCTION, INC.						No Bid						
R. B. JERGENS						No Bid						
BECKLEY DRILLING & BLASTING						No Bid						
KANAWHA STONE CO.	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	28,622,500.00	2.22	28.60	2.00	2.78	372.00	
SAULS SEISMIC, INC.						No Bid						
GREEN MEADOW SERVICES						No Bid						
BEAR CONTRACTING, LLC						No Bid						
TRITON CONSTRUCTION, INC.						No Bid						
CARPENTER RECLAMATION, INC.						No Bid						
TRUMBULL CORPORATION	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	26,319,443.27	3.32	25.03	4.16	4.56	289.16	
HAYSLETT CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.						No Bid						
CENTRAL CONTRACTING, INC.	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	27,155,000.00	6.86	51.97	7.54	4.37	363.04	