

Bid 15-120
Custodial Supplies

Qty	U/M	VENDOR Description	Liberty Distrib		BWB Enterprise		Phillips Supply		Kanawha Food &		JanPak	
			Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
		DUST MOP/HEAD ONLY - A high performance synthetic/cotton blend with a looped end yard that won't fray or unravel even with intensive laundering, assuring longer life. Preshrunk. 100% synthetic backing 3 1/4" wide keyhole pocket type with snaps or ties. Color backing required. Willen Perma - Loop or equal. SUBMIT DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE AND SPECIFICATIONS										
200	ea	(343844) 12" Yellow - Wilen 512-PL	\$10.50	\$2,100.00	\$4.78	\$956.00	\$5.16	\$1,032.00	\$5.49	\$1,098.00	No Bid	
150	ea	(343846) 30" Red - Wilen 530-PL	\$19.60	\$2,940.00	\$10.49	\$1,573.50	\$11.30	\$1,695.00	No bid		No Bid	
200	ea	(342737) HANDLE - wood lacquered finish, clear, 60" x 15/16" with threaded metal tip. Rubbermaid 6364, Flatt Brush or equal. SUBMIT DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE	\$7.47	\$1,494.00	\$2.20	\$440.00	\$3.00	\$600.00	\$2.93	\$586.00	\$2.15	\$430.00
300	ea	(342783) HANDLE , speedchange, wet mop, 63" x 1c", head 7". White #83, With metal galvanized mop clamp. SUBMIT DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE	\$10.15	\$3,045.00	\$4.99	\$1,497.00	\$6.21	\$1,863.00	\$5.85	\$1,755.00	\$5.40	\$1,620.00
200	ea	(342786) HANDLE , speedchange, wet mop, 54" x 1", head 6". White #72 with metal galvanized mop clamp. SUBMIT DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE	No bid		\$3.84	\$768.00	\$5.67	\$1,134.00	\$3.86	\$772.00	No bid	
80	ea	(358910) 400 - Polishing Pads, 17" white. PADS-polishing, scrubbing, stripping, and spray buff, permeated throughout. Polyester/nylon, 3m thickline or equal. SUBMIT DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE	\$9.57	\$765.60	\$9.68	\$774.40	\$16.32	\$1,305.60	\$12.08	\$966.40	\$9.75	\$780.00
		DELIVERY ____ # OF DAYS	14		14 days		14-21 days		7-10 days		10 days	
		GRAND TOTAL		\$10,344.60		\$6,008.90		\$7,629.60		\$5,177.40		\$2,830.00
		# OF ADDENDA, IF ANY										
			Literature submitted		Literature submitted Lowest bid 4 items out of 6 items		Literature & Certificate of Ins. Submitted		Literature submitted		Literature submitted	

Bid 15-120
Custodial Supplies

