

		VENDOR	SCHOOL SPECIALTY			CANNON SPORTS INC				
Qty	U/M	Description	Brand	Unit Price	Total	BRAND	Unit Price	Total	Qty	U/M
100	ea	(701006) <b>FOOTBALL</b> – Official size and weight, standard senior size, rubber covered, pebble grain exterior finish for ball control, waterproof/simulated seams and molded laces, heavy duty construction, end stripes and replaceable valves. Voit CF9S or equal.	Sportime	\$6.38	\$638.00	CSI (ES) CSI 2030 P.50	\$4.11	\$411.00	100	ea
100	Ea	(701008) <b>FOOTBALL</b> – Junior size, yellow rubber, high visibility. Voit VC7Y or equal.	Sportime	\$7.29	\$729.00	(ES) CHAMPION-20313 p.50	\$4.49	\$449.00	100	Ea
50	ea	(701014) <b>SOCCEBALL</b> – Official size and weight #5, synthetic leather, nylon windings, 2 ply Butyl bladder, waterproof and scuff resistant, 32 panel, replaceable valve FIFA approved MacGregor LS303		NO BID		P 104 (ES) MILASA-49181	\$10.50	\$525.00	50	ea
		<b>PLAYGROUND BALLS – 2 PLY CONSTRUCTION 100% NATURAL RUBBER, STIPPLE FINISH REPLACEABLE VALVE, PUNCTURE RESISTANT.</b>								
100	ea	(701009) <b>6” diameter</b> - Voit PG6H or equal.	SCHOOL SMART	\$1.11	\$111.00	(ES) CSI-9541 P.50	\$2.24	\$224.00	100	ea
50	ea	(701010) <b>8 ½” diameter</b> – Voit PG85H or equal.	SCHOOL SMART	\$2.01	\$100.50	(ES) CSI-9543 P.50	\$3.50	\$175.00	50	ea
90	ea	(701079) <b>FRISBEE</b> – Flying disc – 141-145 gram, Plastic – 10”	SPIN JAMMER 140 GRAMS	\$3.26	\$293.40	(AS) CSI 2120 P.59	\$3.00	\$270.00	90	ea

		<b>JUMPING ROPES – POLY WITH PLASTIC HANDLES</b>								
100	ea	(701068) 7' speed rope.	EXERROPE	\$1.13	\$113.00	(AS) CSI P.78 9521	\$0.96	\$96.00	100	ea
60	ea	(701071) 16' speed rope	EXERROPE	\$1.72	\$103.20	(AS) CSO P.78 95026	\$1.89	\$113.40	60	ea
		<b>FLOOR TAPE, PLASTIC – 60 yards x 1"</b>								
120	ea	(701061) White	SPORTIME	\$1.58	\$189.60		<b>NO BID</b>		120	ea
		<b>SOFT FOAM ATHLETIC BALLS- SKINNED URETHANE, FOAM COMPOUND WITH SKIN COATING, DURABLE TO WITHSTAND STANDARD PLAYGROUND USE</b>								
60	ea	(701080) <b>FOOTBALL</b> , 9" long		NO BID		(AS) CSI P.55 21045	\$3.54	\$212.40	60	ea
70	ea	(701081) <b>SOCCEBALL</b> , 7 3/4" diameter.	SPORTIME	\$5.28	\$369.60	(AS) CSI P.55 21046	\$5.64	\$396.80	70	ea
40	ea	(701055) <b>RACQUET BADMINTON</b> – aluminum or steel chrome plated head and shaft, coated steel string for ultimate durability, sure-grip handle (rubber) for rugged use. Guaranteed string breakage.	SPORTIME YELLER	\$4.36	\$174.40	(ES) CSI-P.6 0200 (SILVER SHAFT/BLA CK FRAME	\$2.67	\$106.80	40	ea
		GRAND TOTAL:			\$2,821.70			\$2,979.40		
		Number of addendums received, if any:								

Bid awarded to School Specialty. Low bid on 5 out of 10 line items.

VENDOR	S & S WORLDWIDE		
Description	Brand	Unit Price	Total
(701006) <b>FOOTBALL</b> – Official size and weight, standard senior size, rubber covered, pebble grain exterior finish for ball control, waterproof/simulated seams and molded laces, heavy duty construction, end stripes and replaceable valves. Voit CF9S or equal.	S & S W4917001	\$4.10	\$410.00
(701008) <b>FOOTBALL</b> – Junior size, yellow rubber, high visibility. Voit VC7Y or equal.		NO BID	
(701014) <b>SOCCERBALL</b> – Official size and weight #5, synthetic leather, nylon windings, 2 ply Butyl bladder, waterproof and scuff resistant, 32 panel, replaceable valve FIFA approved MacGregor LS303	MIKASA W12190	\$27.42	\$1,371.00
<b>PLAYGROUND BALLS – 2 PLY CONSTRUCTION 100% NATURAL RUBBER, STIPPLE FINISH REPLACEABLE VALVE, PUNCTURE RESISTANT.</b>			
(701009) <b>6” diameter</b> - Voit PG6H or equal.		NO BID	
(701010) <b>8 ½” diameter</b> – Voit PG85H or equal.	<b>S&amp;S W6055</b>	\$3.20	\$160.00
(701079) <b>FRISBEE</b> – Flying disc – 141-145 gram, Plastic – 10”		NO BID	

<b>JUMPING ROPES – POLY WITH PLASTIC HANDLES</b>			
(701068) 7' speed rope.	S&S W5001002	\$0.89	\$89.00
(701071) 16' speed rope		NO BID	
<b>FLOOR TAPE, PLASTIC – 60 yards x 1"</b>			
(701061) White	S&S W4539WT	\$1.99	\$238.80
<b>SOFT FOAM ATHLETIC BALLS- SKINNED URETHANE, FOAM COMPOUND WITH SKIN COATING, DURABLE TO WITHSTAND STANDARD PLAYGROUND USE.</b>			
(701080) <b>FOOTBALL</b> , 9" long	GATOR SKIN	\$7.02	\$421.20
(701081) <b>SOCCERBALL</b> , 7 3/4" diameter.	GATOR SKIN	\$7.05	\$493.50
(701055) <b>RACQUET BADMINTON</b> – aluminum or steel chrome plated head and shaft, coated steel string for ultimate durability, sure-grip handle (rubber) for rugged use. Guaranteed string breakage.	S&S W8262	\$4.09	\$163.60
GRAND TOTAL:			\$3,347.10
Number of addendums received, if any:			