

**Exhibit A Price Sheet**  
**Bid # 17 -105 --Food Equipment**

| Item Number | Description  | Quantity/ Each | Kanawha Food Equipement | Modern Equipment | C&T Design  | Douglas Equipment | Hooten Equipment | Pierson Refrigeration |
|-------------|--|----------------|-------------------------|------------------|-------------|-------------------|------------------|-----------------------|
| 1           | Blodgett oven (model DFG-100, 115 volts/BTU 27,500) or South Bend Gold Series                  | 1              | No Bid                  | \$9,852.00       | \$6,727.00  | \$12,470.38       | \$6,580.00       | \$7,434.43            |
| 2           | 3 Door Reach In Freezer<br>Cornelius - Model -<br>(COR74RFTMT)                                 | 1              | No Bid                  | \$5,390.00       | \$4,978.00  | \$6,574.00        | \$7,995.00       | \$8,740.98            |
| 3           | Hot Food Serving Counter)<br>Delfield Model # SH – 4 –NU                                       | 1              | No Bid                  | No Bid           | \$9,406.17  | \$7,476.84        | \$8,090.00       | \$8,746.55            |
| 4           | Cleveland, Direct Steam Kettle,<br>Cabinetized Model KDM – 40<br>–T(Power Tilt) 40 gallons     | 1              | No Bid                  | \$21,305.00      | \$22,327.00 | \$17,906.31       | \$19,135.00      | \$26,774.90           |
| 5           | Combi Oven, CTP1—10G—Gas   | 1              | No Bid                  | No Bid           | \$13,837.00 | \$17,071.88       | \$17,565.00      | \$16,891.68           |
| 6           | Serving Counter, Hot Food,<br>Electric- Titan Stainless Steel                                  | 1              | No Bid                  | No Bid           | No Bid      | NO Bid            | \$6,690.00       | No Bid                |
| 7           | Serving Counter, Hot Food,<br>Electric- Titan Stainless Steel                                  | 1              | No Bid                  | No Bid           | \$6,477.00  | \$3,565.65        | \$3,507.00       | \$4,654.06            |
| 8           | Three Compartment Sink, John<br>Boos, Model # 43PB18244-<br>2018                               | 1              | No Bid                  | \$3,550.00       | \$2,642.00  | \$2,402.78        | \$2,858.00       | \$3,625.38            |
| 9           | HD Range, 18", ADD-A-Unit, 2<br>Open Burners, Imperial,<br>Diamond Series Heavy Duty<br>Range: | 1              | No Bid                  | \$3,270.00       | \$2,678.00  | NO Bid            | \$2,079.00       | \$2,540.40            |
| 10          | Booster Heater, Hatco, Imperial<br>Booster Heater, Electric                                    | 1              | No Bid                  | \$2,391.00       | \$1,787.00  | \$2,090.55        | \$2,060.00       | \$2,508.66            |
| 11          | Dishwasher, Door Type, Hobart,<br>hot water / Chemical sanitizing                              | 1              | No Bid                  | No Bid           | \$9,427.00  | \$8,325.80        | \$8,500.00       | \$10,308.42           |
| 12          | Clean Dish-table, John Boos,<br>Dish table, clean, straight design                             | 1              | No Bid                  | \$891.00         | \$585.00    | \$534.64          | \$495.00         | \$650.42              |

|  |   |   |            |            |            |            |            |            |
|--|---|---|------------|------------|------------|------------|------------|------------|
| 13   | Reach-In Refrigerator – Traulsen – Dealer’s Choice Refrigerator   | 1 | \$3,169.00 | \$3,250.00 | \$3,127.00 | \$3,451.89 | \$3,440.00 | \$3,998.42 |
| 14   | Reach-In-Freezer – Traulsen Dealer’s Choice freezer - 46 cu. ft.  | 1 | \$4,050.00 | \$4,150.00 | \$3,727.00 | \$4,191.70 | \$4,200.00 | \$4,914.81 |
| 15   | Utility Cart, Lakeside Manufacturing,(2) shelves with open base, 27”W x 17-1/2”D x 35-3/4”H                                   | 1 | \$299.00   | No Bid     | \$585.00   | \$510.40   | \$585.00   | \$421.04   |
| 16   | Beverage-Air – School Milk Cooler – Model # SMF58   | 1 | \$3,039.00 | \$2,541.00 | \$2,372.00 | \$2,581.94 | \$2,995.00 | \$3,995.86 |
| 17   | Ice Machine Manitococ – Model # UY-0140A NEO 26" Air Cooled Undercounter Half Size Cube Ice Machine with 90 lb. Bin - 132 lb. | 1 | \$1,825.00 | \$2,085.00 | \$2,057.00 | \$1,724.25 | \$1,695.00 | \$2,151.67 |
| 18   | PLANETARY MIXER Food Mixer, 30-qt. capacity bowl, variable speed, 2 HP, overload protection, powder paint finish              | 1 | \$6,588.00 | \$5,195.00 | \$4,927.00 | \$7,805.00 | \$7,745.00 | \$7,789.82 |
| * Split Award      Highlighted item is the lowest priced bid item. |   |   |            |            |            |            |            |            |