

15-141 ART SUPPLIES											
		QUILL			STANDARD STATIONERY			PYRAMID			
QTY	U/M	DESCRIPTION	BRAND	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	BRAND	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	BRAND	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
		RUBBER BANDS , ¼ lb., good quality, purerubber (not crepe) seamless. Sizes as follows: Accepted Brands: Alliance or equal.									
100	Box	(604566) assorted sizes, 1/4 lb. box	Quill	\$0.73	\$73.25	General - 54	\$0.58	\$57.80	Alliance Advantage - 06547	\$0.72	\$72.00
3000	ea	(607050) NOTEBOOK BINDERS , 1", (3 RING), 11/X8 1/2". Accepted Brands: Wilson Jones 368-14 or equal. SAMPLE MUST ACCOMPANY BID	Quill	\$1.55	\$4,650.00	Tops 90310	\$0.92	\$2,754.00	Samsil 11300	\$ 0.91	\$ 2,730.00
1200	ea	(607052) NOTEBOOK BINDERS , 1 1/2", (3 ring), 11" x 8 1/2. Accepted Brands: Samsil #18557C or equal	Quill	\$1.89	\$2,268.00	Tops 90320	\$1.47	\$1,764.00	Samsil 18557C	\$1.30	\$1,560.00
800	Bx	(617544) E-Z CLIPS , #102, adhesive back adheres tp chalkboard, wood, metal, glass or concrete, 20/box	Education Resources	\$4.46	\$3,568.00	EZ102	\$2.22	\$1,776.00	EZ Up Clips	\$2.19	\$1,752.00
						Restick ClipRSC20	\$1.67	\$1,336.00			
600	Bx	(617552) PAPER CLIPS , silver, 100/box, 1 3/8' length. Accepted Brand: Gem # 1	Charles Leonard	\$2.44	\$1,464.00	OIC PC-1	\$0.14	\$86.40	Leonard 201E	\$0.15	\$90.00
1000	Bx	(617554) PAPER CLIPS, Giant Corrugated, strong rustproof, 2" length. Accepted Brand: Jumbo Grip It	Quill	\$0.51	\$510.00	OIC PC-GN	\$0.43	\$430.00	Leonard 302	\$0.39	\$390.00

			QUILL		STANDARD STATIONERY			PYRAMID			
200	Bx	(617530) BINDER CLIPS , Steelwire, black, small 3/4" wide, 12/box. Handles can be used for hanging, folded flat against clipped material or removed for permanent binding		\$0.18	\$36.00	General BC-20	\$0.16	\$32.80	Pyramid 1199660	\$0.18	\$36.00
300	Bx	(617532) BINDER CLIPS , Steel wire, black, medium, 1 1/4" wide, 12/box. Handles can be used for hanging, folded flat against clipped material or removed for permanent binding		\$0.45	\$135.00	General BC-50	\$0.39	\$116.40	Pyramid 111066	\$0.40	\$120.00
200	Bx	(617534) BINDER CLIPS , Steel wire, black, large 2" wide, 12/box. Handles can be used for hanging, folded flat against clipped material or removed for permanent binding.		\$1.19	\$238.00	General BC-100	\$1.01	\$202.00	Pyramid 1116075	\$1.04	\$208.00
200	Bx	(617536) BINDER CLIPS , Steel wire, black, assorted, 30/box (12 mini, 12 small, 6 medium). Handles can be used for hanging, folded flat against clipped material or removed for permanent binding.		\$0.79	\$158.00	NO BID		\$0.00	Acco A7071130	\$2.79	\$558.00
600	ea	(617538) CLIP BOARDS , hardboard smooth front and back surfaces, built-in hanging hole, 1" clip capacity		\$0.80	\$480.00	Standard - 05612	\$0.59	\$352.80	Pyramid 1162437	\$0.61	\$366.00
400	Ea	(618884) COMPASS , Circle Master to be used with any type of marking device. Retractable points, aluminum with vinyl finish. Accepted Brand: Learning Resources 45743: SAMPLE MUST ACCOMPANY BID	NO BID		\$0.00	Standard G-591 Bow	\$0.60	\$240.00	Learning Resources 45743	\$ 0.99	\$ 396.00

		QUILL			STANDARD STATIONERY			PYRAMID			
8000	Ea	(620578) STUDENT PORTFOLIO , 8 1/2" x 11", with three (3) fasteners and two (2) inside pockets. Accepted Brands: DueTang 54128, Oxford	QUILL	\$0.32	\$2,560.00	Oxford S0770	\$0.25	\$2,016.00	Oxford 50770 (125/cs)	\$0.20	\$1,600.00
						Standard	\$0.17	\$1,376.00			
400	Bx	(628570) PAPER FASTENERS , #2, (1/2) 100/box, round head. Accepted Brand: Noesting or equal.	Office Mate	\$0.70	\$280.00	General 2	\$0.56	\$223.60	Leonard 2RBP	\$0.49	\$196.00
600	ea	(631012) CORRECTION TAPE , Dryline, Handheld, disposable. Accepted Brand: Liquid Paper Dryline 660415 SAMPLE MUST ACCOMPANY BID	Liquid Paper	\$1.83	\$1,098.00	Liquid Paper - 660415	\$1.69	\$1,014.00	Liquid Paper 660415	\$1.65	\$990.00
						Tom bow 68772	\$0.74	\$444.00			
						TC985	\$0.45	\$270.00			
400	Bx	(631548) FOLDERS , 1/2 cut, good quality, manila, letter size, scored at the bottom for greater capacity, 100 folders in sturdy, durable box which can be stacked, 11 point. Accepted Brands: Smead, Oxford, Warshaw, Globe-Weiss	Quill	\$11.58	\$4,632.00	Oxford 752 1/3	\$5.82	\$2,328.00	Oxford 752 1/2 (5 Bx)	\$5.81	\$2,324.00
1400	Set	(636076) SUBJECT INDEX GUIDES , Color Tabs, 3 holes, 5/set for 8 1/2" x 11" binder. Accepted Brand: Celludex CR-13 or Kleerfax 05119	Quill	\$0.20	\$280.00	Premier 5 A	\$0.21	\$299.60	Kleerfax 05119	\$0.24	\$336.00
300	ea	(647355) LABELS, LASER COPIER , 1 x 2 5/8 white, 30/sheet, 100 sheets/bx. Accepted Brand: Avery 30600	Avery	\$6.66	\$1,998.00	Avery 30600	\$4.29	\$1,287.00	Avery 30600	\$4.35	\$1,305.00
						Shur Stick 5160	\$3.95	\$1,185.00			

		QUILL			STANDARD STATIONERY			PYRAMID			
8000	Ea	(649570) SQUARE DEAL NOTEBOOKS , white, 30/sheet, 100 sheets/box. Accepted Brand: Mead 09-9100, Roaring Springs	NO BID		\$0.00	Roaring Springs - 77230	\$0.75	\$6,000.00	Tops 63795 (12/cs)	\$0.75	\$6,000.00
2000	Ea	(649513) NOTEBOOKS, COMPOSITION , 80 sheets, wirebound, wide ruling/margin, 8" x 10 1/2", clear tear perforated pages. Accepted Brands: Top Flight, Mead	NO BID		\$0.00	Roaring Springs 10021	\$0.54	\$1,078.00	Tops 65000 (70 Sheets- 24/cs)	\$0.50	\$1,000.00
						Tops (70 sheets)	\$0.49	\$978.00			
800	Ea	(649515) NOTEBOOKS, COMPOSITION , 180 sheets, wirebound wide ruling w/margin, 8" x 10 1/2" clear, tear perforated pages. Accepted Brands: Smead, Data Com	NO BID		\$0.00	Roaring Springs 10080	\$1.42	\$1,136.00	Tops 65058 (24/cs)	\$1.50	\$1,200.00
400	Ea	(649575) STENOGRAPHIC NOTEBOOKS , green tint, 80 pages, Gregg ruling. Accepted Brands: SCM #846, Topps Roaring Springs	Quill	0.46	184	Tops - 8021	\$0.56	\$224.80	Tops 8021 (72/cs)	\$0.57	\$228.00
2600	Ea	(651032) PADS, legal, 8 1/2" x 11" , 16# basis, white, lined, east to teat, perforated sheets, 50 sheets/pad. Accepted Brands: Data Com P3-91XX, SCM 911, Topps, Topp Flight	Quill	\$0.27	\$702.00	Tops - 7533	\$4.84	\$12,584.00	Tops 7533 (72/cs)	\$0.41	\$1,066.00
100	Dz	(651072) SCRATCH PAD, 4" X 6" , 16# basis, white, suitable for both pen and pencil. 100 sheets/pad. Brands Accepted: SCM #846, Data Com	Ampad	\$4.81	\$481.00	NO BID			APC 4600	\$3.89	\$389.00
200	Dz	(651060) POST-IT NOTE PADS, 1" X 2" , yellow, 100 sheets/pad. Accepted Brands: Scotch 653, 3M Post-It.	3M	\$3.63	\$726.00	Beutone 11110	\$0.96	\$192.80	Scotch 653	\$3.39	\$678.00
						Scotch 653	\$3.26	\$652.00			
						3M Highland 6539	\$1.05	\$210.00			

			QUILL			STANDARD STATIONERY			PYRAMID		
300	Dz	(651062) POST-IT NOTE PADS, 3' X 3' , yellow, 100 sheets/pad. Accepted Brands: Scotch 653, 3M Post-It.	3M	\$8.44	\$2,532.00	Beautone 11030	\$1.98	\$594.00	Scotch 654	\$8.76	\$2,628.00
						Scotch 654	\$7.72	\$2,316.00			
						3M Highland 6549	\$2.30	\$690.00			
100	Dz	(651064) POST-IT NOTE PADS, 3"X5" , yellow, 100 sheets/pad. Accepted Brands: Scotch 653, 3M Post-it	3M	\$12.67	\$1,267.00	Beautone 11050	\$2.94	\$294.00	Scotch 655	\$11.40	\$1,140.00
						Scotch 655	\$10.16	\$1,016.00			
						3M Highland	\$3.26	\$326.00			
400	Ea	(66528) FILE POCKET, 14 3/4 x 9 1/2" with 1 3/4 expansion, heavy weight red fiber with double backed lined manila fiber, drop front style, cloth reinforced at top of gussets to prevent tearing. Accepted Brands: Smead C1516C, Globe Weiss, Oxford	NO BID		\$0.00	Tops Globe Weis 64940	\$0.40	\$160.40	Tops Globe Weiss, 1516C (64214) (100/cs)	\$0.45	\$180.00
100	Bx	(666588) POCKET FILE FOLDERS , legal, 1" expansion, packed 50 folders/box. Accepted Brands: Smead 2-4940, Globe Weill, Oxford	Quill	\$9.91	\$991.00	Tops Globe Weis 2-4940	\$13.04	\$1,304.00	Tops Globe Weiss 24940 (4/bxs/cs)	\$13.09	\$1,309.00
600	Bx	(669178) SHEET PROTECTOR , Top Load, Economy Weight, Clear , 100/box. Accepted Brands: Sparco	NO BID		\$0.00	Premier 41293	\$2.57	\$1,542.00	Pyramid110213 6	\$2.95	\$1,770.00
1200	Ea	(669224) PROTRACTOR, INDIVIDUAL , 6" diameter, crystal clean plastic. Acceptable Brands: Status Plus 40-441 or equal.	Educators Resource	\$0.36	\$432.00	Standard 16231W	\$0.08	\$100.80	Status Plus 40-001 (1111145)	\$0.11	\$132.00

			QUILL			STANDARD STATIONERY			PYRAMID		
100	Ea	(669565) PAPER PUNCHES , hand <u>Gem Light Duty</u> , spring action steel punch with knurled handles and finer ring for an easy grip, 1/4" diameter round hole for punching paper, cards, etc.	Quill	\$0.98	\$98.00	General G-1	0.394	\$39.40	Pyramid 111116	\$0.50	\$50.00
2000	Ea	(675048) RULERS, 12" Plastic, Inches and Centimeters. Accepted Brands: Standard 16220 or Equal	Westcott	\$0.44	\$880.00	Standard 16220	0.097	\$194.00	Pyramid 1111558	\$0.13	\$260.00
3600	Ea	(675050) RULERS, 12" , 1/16" marking on one edge and metric scale on other, plastic. Accepted Brand: Wescott R410	NO BID		\$0.00	Standard 1G220 plastic	\$0.10	\$349.20	Wescott R410 (10526)	\$0.15	\$540.00
						KSG11 Wood	0.094	\$338.40			
						Standard KSG09	0.078	\$280.80			
300	Ea	(675052) RULERS, 12" 1/2" scale, wooden. SEND SAMPLE.	NO BID		\$0.00	Standard 2302-2	0.076	\$22.80	Aakron 100202	\$0.13	\$39.00
800	Pr	(679505) SCISSORS, Art, 6" , made of heavy gauged forged steel, lightweight, life nickel plated blade, with cushioned handles. Accepted Brands: Snippy S706, Acme 42S6	NO BID		\$0.00	Armada 240-6	0.732	\$585.60	Snippy S240-6	\$0.80	\$640.00
						Acme 10570	0.436	\$348.80			
1600	Pr	(679507) SCISSORS, 2 1/2" , hand ground, blunt end, easy to manipulate, made of heavy gauge forged steel, fully nickel plated, comfortable finger grip, cushioned handle, left or right-handed. Accepted Brands: Snippy B855, Acme 242,B6	NO BID		\$0.00	General E941G	\$0.19	\$310.40	Snippy B855	\$0.49	\$784.00
						Standard9416	\$0.22	\$348.80			
						Acme 425-B-5	\$0.22	\$348.80			
						Snippy B855	\$0.43	\$694.40			

			QUILL			STANDARD STATIONERY			PYRAMID		
1200	Pr	(679576) SCISSORS, 2 1/2" blade , hand ground, pointed end, easy to manipulate, made of heavy gauge forged steel, fully nickel plated, comfortable finger grip, cushioned handle, left or right-handed. Accepted	NO BID		\$0.00	General E9430	\$0.19	\$232.80	Snippy S855	\$0.49	\$588.00
						Standard 9430	\$0.22	\$262.09			
						Acme 425-S-5	\$0.22	\$261.60			
						Snippy S855	0.434	\$520.80			
300	Ea	(685064) STAPLERS , full size desk stapler with 4" throat depth, 8 1/2" overall, smooth easy operation, loads 210 strip of standard staples, open channel loading must tack pin and staple. Accepted Brands: Swingline 747	Swingline	\$8.97	\$2,691.00	Swingline 747	\$7.32	\$2,196.00	Arco	\$7.89	\$2,367.00
						Standard 550	\$2.67	\$801.00			
						Standard 220	\$1.57	\$471.00			
						Bostitch B440	\$3.11	\$933.00			
100	Ea	(673025) STAPLE REMOVERS . Accepted Brands: Swingline 100 or equal	Swingline	\$0.30	\$30.00	General 32002	\$0.18	\$18.40	Pyramid - 1111384	\$0.19	\$19.00
200	Ea	(625022) TAPE DISPENSERS , desk-type, approximately 5" long, for 1" core tapes up to 3/4" width, chip-proof and plastic weighted for easier use. Accepted Brand: Scotch C-38.		\$1.91	\$382.00	Standard C-38	\$0.79	\$157.60	Scotch C38 (12/(S))	\$1.99	\$398.00
1800	rl	(691016) DISPENSER TAPE , clear, transparent, non-yellow, 3/4" wide, 1,296 " long 1" core. Accepted Brand: Scotch 600	Scotch - 6001212= 1/2"	\$1.27	\$2,286.00	Scotch 660	\$1.31	\$2,358.00	Scotch 600 (144/cs)	\$1.35	\$2,430.00
						TapeMate 5000	\$0.27	\$493.20			

		Quill			STANDARD STATIONERY			PYRAMID			
800	rl	(691034) TAPE, MAGIC MENDING , hand dispenser type, 3/4" x 300", invisible, won't discolor, can be written on with pen, pencil, or typewriter, permanent, unaffected by climate change. Accepted Brand: Scotch 105	Scotch	\$0.89	\$712.00	Tape Mate 3300	\$0.34	\$270.40	Scotch 105	\$0.69	\$552.00
						Scotch 105	\$0.65	\$518.40			
		MASKING TAPE , bulk packed, sizes as follows: Accepted Brand: 3M High Performance 232	Scotch								
200	rl	(691044) 1/2" x 60 yards	Scotch - 23412	\$2.08	\$416.00	Edge E83 1/2	\$0.39	\$78.80	3M 2321/2	\$2.95	\$590.00
						3M 232	\$3.37	\$674.00			
200	rl	(691004) ADDING MACHINE TAPE , 2 1/4" width, good grade, white bond paper, lint free, precision cut, warning signal in each roll, Length of roll: _____	QUILL 740102 *	\$0.27	\$54.00	Tops 7280	\$0.38	\$76.80	Tops 7280 (100/cs)	\$0.29	\$58.00
60	pad	(689520) CHART TABLET , 1 1/2" ruled, 16" x 24" spiralbound, 25 sheets/pad. Accepted Brands: Bemiss-Jason, Pacon	BwMiss Jason 74720	\$2.30	\$138.00	APC AP5241SH 24 cases - ** (72 pads) *	\$1.84	\$132.48	American Paper APS 2415H (24/cs)	\$1.89	\$113.40
60	pad	(689521) CHART TABLET , unruled, 16" x 24" spiralbound, 25 sheets/pad. Accepted Brands: American Paper, Bemiss-Jason, Pacon	NO BID		\$0.00	APC - APS24PH 24 cases, ** (72 pads)	\$1.84	\$132.48	American Paper APS524PH (24/case)	\$1.89	\$113.40
		# of addendums received, if any"									
		Total			\$39,430.25			\$65,440.45			\$42,290.80
		Price Retention Date:									6/30/2015
			*Only item awarded, not worth ordering 1 item. Not worth cutting PO for 1 item				*APC "All or None"		Minimum Orders by Mfg., Samsill \$800.00 in full cases, Oxford \$1100.00 in full cases, Tops \$800.00 in full cases.		

CASCADE SCHOOL SUPPLIES			STATIONERS INC			SCHOOL SPECIALTY INC			KURTZ BROS		
BRAND	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	BRAND	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	BRAND	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	BRAND	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
Alliance Rubber120200	\$0.68	\$68.00	Alliance 26547	\$0.82	\$82.00	Alliance	\$0.71	\$71.00	Alliance Rubber, #5H	\$0.73	\$73.00
Cascade 118889	\$0.82	\$2,460.00	Cardinal 90310	\$1.08	\$3,240.00	School Smart	\$1.37	\$4,110.00	Kurtz Brothers	\$0.85	\$2,550.00
Cascade 005470	\$1.01	\$1,212.00	Cardinal 90320	\$1.73	\$2,076.00	Samsil	\$4.26	\$5,112.00	Kurtz Brothers #03018	\$1.00	\$1,200.00
Stikki Works 119033	\$2.29	\$1,832.00	NO BID		\$0.00	Stikkiworks	\$2.23	\$1,784.00	Lectro Stick Corp #01220	\$2.29	\$1,832.00
OfficeMate 118996	\$0.14	\$84.00	OfficeMate 99911	\$0.14	\$84.00	School Smart	\$0.14	\$84.00	Clipmall Gem #1	\$0.13	\$78.00
Clipmall	\$0.35	\$350.00	Officemate 99915	\$0.45	\$450.00	School Smart	\$0.44	\$440.00	Clipmall Gen #PCGF	\$0.35	\$350.00
					\$0.00						

CASCADE SCHOOL SUPPLIES			STATIONERS INC			SCHOOL SPECIALTY			KURTZ BROS		
Cascade 109449	\$0.20	\$40.00	Business Source	\$0.18	\$36.00	School Smart	\$0.18	\$36.00	Clipmall #BC02	\$0.20	\$40.00
Cascade 109450	\$0.43	\$129.00	Business Source 36551	\$0.51	\$153.00	School Smart	\$0.38	\$114.00	Clipmall #11420	\$0.50	\$150.00
Cascade 109451	\$1.10	\$220.00	Business Source 36552	\$1.35	\$270.00	School Smart	\$0.91	\$182.00	Clipmall #BC10	\$1.22	\$244.00
OfficeMate	\$2.32	\$464.00	NO BID		\$0.00	School Smart	\$0.82	\$164.00	OfficeMat e # 31026	\$2.24	\$448.00
Clipmall 120840	\$0.61	\$366.00	Office Mate	\$0.85	\$510.00	School Smart	\$0.77	\$462.00	Clipmall # CDLT 9"x12 1/2"	\$0.61	\$366.00
Musco Sport 151361 sold per dozen	\$1.49	\$596.00	NO BID		\$0.00	Learning Resources - this is priced as a pk of 30. 031- 1486 al. pk of 30. Total of 400 would be	\$16.67	\$216.71	Learning Resources #45743	\$0.83	\$332.00

CASCADE SCHOOL SUPPLIES			STATIONERS INC			SCHOOL SPECIALTY			KURTZ BROS		
Cascade 028171 - sold 25/bx, priced/ea	\$0.18	\$1,440.00	NO BID		\$0.00	School Smart - 320 sold & priced as 25 box. Alt 084901	\$3.89	\$1,244.80	Esselte Corp #57715 Sold 25/	\$0.35	\$2,800.00
Cascade 119047	\$0.55	\$220.00	NO BID		\$0.00	School Smart	\$0.48	\$192.00	Clipmall	\$0.36	\$144.00
Newell 124562	\$1.81	\$1,086.00	PaperMate	\$2.12	\$1,272.00	Liquid Paper - 660415	\$1.94	\$1,164.00	Sanford Liquid Paper #6137106	\$1.33	\$798.00
Cascade 121277	\$5.52	\$2,208.00	Smead 10320	\$9.61	\$3,844.00	NECI	\$8.32	\$3,328.00	Kurtz Brothers #13212	\$5.77	\$2,308.00
Kler Fax 121245	\$0.26	\$364.00	NO BID		\$0.00	NO BID		\$0.00	Kirtz Brothers 05119	\$0.22	\$308.00
Avery 029642	\$22.90	\$6,870.00	Avery 30600	\$5.05	\$1,515.00	NO BID		\$0.00	Avery #05160	\$23.70	\$7,110.00
					\$0.00						

CASCADE SCHOOL SUPPLIES			STATIONERS INC			SCHOOL SPECIALTY			KURTZ BROS		
3M030080	\$0.56	\$672.00	NO BID		\$0.00	School Smart	\$0.50	\$600.00	Snippy American Pint Fastener	\$0.39	\$468.00
					\$0.00						
Arco	\$10.03	\$3,009.00	Swingline 74701	\$10.48	\$3,144.00	Swingline 747	\$10.82	\$3,246.00	Swingline #74701	\$9.08	\$2,724.00
											\$0.00
Clipmall 119723	\$0.29	\$29.00	Business Source - 65650	\$0.25	\$25.00	School Smart	\$0.22	\$22.00	ClipMall #104A	\$0.25	\$25.00
3M 018680	\$2.20	\$440.00	Business Source 32954	\$1.11	\$222.00	Scotch C - 38	\$2.32	\$464.00	Scotch #C-38	\$2.41	\$482.00
3M123166	\$1.79	\$3,222.00	MMM 600341296	\$1.86	\$3,348.00	Scotch 600	\$1.92	\$3,456.00	Scotch #600	\$1.92	\$3,456.00

